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Chemical Engineering.  
NIT Hamirpur was a dream come true for me, 

and my time there was truly transformative. 
The Chemical Engineering department, with 
dedicated professors like Dr. Tapas Palai and 
Dr. Radhe Shyam, provided exceptional 
guidance and motivation, deepening my 
passion for the field. I had the privilege of 
writing my B.Tech thesis under Prof. Dr. 
Amer S. Singha, whose exceptional 
mentorship enhanced my research skills and 
analytical thinking. The well-structured 
curriculum, hands-on learning, and 
inspiring faculty encouraged me to pursue 
further studies. The serene campus, vibrant 
student life, and strong peer network made 
my years truly memorable. For future 
students, NIT Hamirpur offers an academic 
environment that fosters growth, innovation, 
and critical thinking. With its dedicated 
faculty and excellent facilities, it equips 
students to excel in their chosen fields and 
face the challenges of tomorrow. Proud to be 

an NIT Hamirpur alumnus! 
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